
TOWNSHIP OF ABINGTON 

(1) PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE 

February 1, 2017 
7:00 P.M. 

CALL TO ORDER 

ROLL CALL: HECKER - FARREN - KLINE - MYERS - ROTHMAN 

MINUTES: 

PWl. 

PW2. 

PW3. 

Township Manager LEFEVRE 
Assistant Township Manager WEHMEYER 
Township Solicitor CLARKE 
Township Engineer POWERS 
Director of Code Enforcement MATTEO 
Director of Public Works MICCIOLO 
Director ofW.W.T.P. WRIGLEY 

Motion to approve the minutes of the November 28, 2016 Public 
Works Committee Meeting. 

Bid Award - Ready Mix Concrete 

Motion to accept the lowest Responsible Bidder and enter into a 
contract with Delaware Valley Concrete for the purchase of 
Ready Mix Concrete as per bid specifications. 

Bid Awa:rd - Super Pave Asphalt Paving Material 

Motion to accept the lowest Responsible Bidder and enter into a 
contract with Eureka Stone Quarry for Part I and Part II of the 
bid in the amount of $724,090.00 for the purchase of Super Pave 
Materials as per bid specifications. 

Resolution No. 17-011 - Authorizing the 2014-2017 PaDOT 
Project Letter Agreement for the Moreland Road Overlay Project 

Motion to adopt Resolution No. 17-011 authorizing the Township 
of Abington to execute the 2014-2017 PaDOT Project Letter 
Agreement fo:r the Moreland Road overlay project. If manhole 
castings :require adjustment, the potential costs could be 
$17,391.00 to be paid f:rom Wastewater Operating Account No. 
02-10-205-5305. 



PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE 

February l, 2017 
DATE 

DEPARTMENT 

Public Works 

PREVIOUS ACTIONS 

BOARD ACTION FORM 

AGENDA ITEM 

Bid Award 
For Ready Mix Concrete 

PWJ 
AGENDA ITEM NUMBER 

TOWNSHIP MANAGER 

Michael Lefevre 

This is a yearly Bid which is put out by the Public Works Department. 

RECOMMENDED BOARD ACTION 

Motion to accept the lowest Responsible Bidder and enter into a contract with Delaware Valley 
Concrete for the purchase of Ready Mix Concrete as per bid specifications. 

COMMENTS 

1. There were 5 bids sent out and we received 3 bids back. 

2. Delaware Valley Concrete was the lowest responsible bid. 

3. The concrete will be used by the Public Works Department primarily as well as other 
departments. The Budgets that these materials will be purchased from are, 01-13-131-5323 
and 03-13-146-5304. 

4. Bid Tabs are attached. 



BIDDER 

ABINGTON TOWNSHIP, DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID TABULATIONS FOR: READY MIX CONCRETE 1/30/2017 

AMOUNT OF BID BID DOCUMENTS OEVIA TIONS I SUBST!TUT!ON5 COMMENTS 

• 5 Cubic Yards $78.50 & Delivery $250.00 

- lO Cubic Yards $78.50 & Delivery $250.00 

Picked Up $153.5 Per Cubic Yard 

- 5 Cubic Yards $100.00 & Delivery $250.00 

- 10 Cubic Yards $100.00 & Delivery $250.00 

Picked Up $100.00 Per Cubic Yard & $60.00 Labor Charge 

- 5 Cubic Yards $94.00 & Delivery $230.00 

- 10 Cubic Yards $74.00 & Delivery $230.00 

Picked Up $100.00 Per Cubic Yard 

NO BID 

NO BID 

IN ORDER 

INCOMPLETE 

IN ORDER 

NONE 

NONE 

NONE 

LOWEST 

RESPONSIBLE 

BIDDER 



PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE 

BOARD ACTION FORM 

February 1, 2017 
DATE AGENDA ITEM NUMBER 

DEPARTMENT AGENDAITEM TOWNSHIP MANAGER 

Public Works Bid Award Michael Lefevre 
Super pave Asphalt Paving Material 

PREVIOUS ACTIONS 

This is a yearly Bid which is put out by the Public Works Department for our Overlay Program, 
patching and other projects. 

RECOMMENDED BOARD ACTION 

Motion to accept the lowest Responsible Bidder and enter into a contract with Eureka Stone 
Quarry for Part I and Part II of the bid in the amount of$724,090.00 for the purchase of Super 
Pave Materials as per bid specifications. 

COMMENTS 

1. The majority of funds to purchase these materials are in the Highway Department budget 
under Road Overlay. The Budget numbers that these materials will be purchase from are, 
07-00-000-2437, 07-13-575-7537 and 01-13-131-5323. 

2. The bid came in under what we had budgeted for materials. Last year we paid $46.00 a ton 
delivered. 

This year the price for delivered materials is $45.40 

3. We sent out 6 bids and we received 3 bids back. 

4. Bid Tabs are attached. 



Bid Tabulations 

BIDDER 
Allan Myers L.P. 

Glascow Inc. 

Highway Materials 

Eureka Stone Quarry 

Miller & Son 

Hanson Aggregates 

Abington Township Department Of Public Works 
Super Pave Material 

15000 TONS DELIVERED 
Wearing 
9.5M.M. 

NO BID 
,, 

$50.90 per ton 

$52.43 per ton 

$45.40 per ton 

NO BID 

NO BID 

1/30/2017 

600 TONS P/U 500 TONS P/U 
Wearing Base Binder 

9.5M.M. 25M.M. 19.0 M.M. 

NO BID NO BID 

$45.00 per ton $39.00 per ton $41.50 per ton 

$46.95 per ton $43.61 per ton $45.97 per ton 

$41.40 per ton $34.00 per ton $36.50 per ton 

NO BID NO BID 



PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE 

February 1, 2017 
DATE 

DEPARTMENT 

Wastewater Utilities 

PREVIOUS ACTIONS 

BOARD ACTION REQUEST 

AGENDA ITEM 

Adopt Resolution No. 17-011 
Authorizing the 2014-2017 PaDOT 
Project Letter Agreement for the 

Moreland Road overlay project 

(J'l/3 
AGENDA ITEM NUMBER 

TOWNSHIP MANAGER 

Michael LeFevre 

Abington has an existing three year (2014-2017) Master Casting Agreement No. 0601068 with 
Pennsylvania Department of Transpo11ation dated May 19, 2015 . The agreement specifies the costs 
to adjust existing manhole castings during resurfacing work perf01med by PaDOT's contractors. 

RECOMMENDED BOARD ACTION 

Motion to adopt Resolution No. 17-011 authorizing the Township of Abington to execute the 2014-
2017 PaDOT Project Letter Agreement for the Moreland Road overlay project. If manhole castings 
require adjustment, the potential costs could be $17,391.00 to be paid from Wastewater Operating 
Account No. 02-10-205-5305 

COMMENTS 

PaDOT has notified Abington that they are anticipating the bidding of a contract for variable depth 
milling and resurfacing of Moreland/Welsh Road (SR0063) between Jarrettown Road and Edge Hill 
Road in 2017. There is a potential for 33 of our sanitary sewer manholes to be affected by this work. 
Since the existing manhole frames are currently at grade, and PaDOT has not indicated that the grade 
of the road surface would be revised, it is anticipated that few or none of the manhole frames would 
need to be adjusted, therefore, Abington would not incur any costs. PaDOT, however, requires that 
Abington indicate, prior to PaDOT' s contract bidding, that we want to incorporate any potential work 
into their contract. The Project Letter Agreement is the documentation of that authorization. 



RESOLUTION NO. 17-011 

PADOTPROJECTLETTERAGREEMENT 

FOR ROADWAY RESURFACING OF SR 0063 -MORELAND ROAD 

TOWNSHIP OF ABINGTON 

MONTGOMERY COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA 

BE IT RESOLVED by the board of Commissioners of the Township of Abington, 
Montgomery County, Pennsylvania, and it is hereby resolved by the authority of the same, 
that the President of the Township of Abington Board of Commissioners be authorized 
and directed to execute the attached PaDOT Project Letter Agreement on its behalf and 
the Secretary be authorized and directed to attest to the same. 

ATTEST: 

Michael leFevre, Secretary 
Township of Abington 

TOWNSHIP OF ABINGTON 

Wayne C. Luker, President 
Board of Commissioners 

DATE: -----------

I, Wayne C. Luker, President of the Township of Abington Board of Commissioners, do 
hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution No. 17-011, that 
was duly adopted at the regularly scheduled public meeting of the Township of Abington 
Board of Commissioners held on the gth day of February, 2017. 


